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1. Date of Press Release: 4/19/13 

 

2. Title of Press Release 

Freehold NJ Orthopedic Surgeon Dr. Alan Nasar elected Chairman of the Department of Orthopedic 
Surgery at CentraState Medical Center.  
.   

3. Summary of Press Release  

 
Advanced Orthopedic and Sports Medicine Institutes' Orthopedic Surgeon, Dr. Alan Nasar has been 

elected Chairman of the Department of Orthopedic Surgery at CentraState Medical Center. 
 

4. Text of Press Release 

 
Advanced Orthopedic and Sports Medicine Institutes' Orthopedic Surgeon, Dr. Alan Nasar has been 

elected Chairman of the Department of Orthopedic Surgery at CentraState Medical Center. 
 
Dr. Nasar was elected by his peers to head the orthopedic department at one of New Jersey's 
premier hospitals; CentraState Medical Center.   
 
Jon Mackler, AOSMI's Chief Operating Officer stated "This is well deserved for Dr. Nasar as he is 
constantly striving for excellence in orthopedic care.  He will, no doubt, bring his passion and 
expertise to the position and help to ensure better orthopedic care..."  
 
As Director of The Total Joint Center of New Jersey at CentraState,  Dr. Nasar has been responsible 

for obtaining  Joint Commission accreditation for hip and knee replacement surgery.  He recently has 
initiated a quality improvement project, which focuses  on rapid recovery and discharge, as well as 
minimizing postoperative pain.  This project helps  facilitate excellent patient outcomes. 
 
Dr. Nasar stated, "Being recognized by my peers and entrusted with the department is a great 
honor.  I enjoy working with my fellow doctors and hospital administrators to make the department 
stronger.  This will enable the department to provide an even higher level of exceptional patient 
treatment and outcomes."   
 
Dr. Nasar is a board certified orthopedic surgeon and holds a degree in mechanical engineering from 
the prestigious Cooper Union for the Advancement of Art and Science in New York City. He became 
interested in artificial joint design while receiving specialized training in biomechanics and 
biomaterials at Cooper Union. Dr. Nasar participated in an additional year of specialization in 
minimally invasive joint replacement surgery in Las Vegas, Nevada.  
 

At CentraState Medical Center, Dr. Nasar has been instrumental in developing and directing The 
Total Joint Center of New Jersey and he is currently its chairman.  After coming on staff at 
CentraState  in 2006, Dr. Nasar became the orthopedic medical director at the Manor Health and 
Rehabilitation Center for CentraState Medical Center in Monmouth County, NJ. 
 



 

Dr. Nasar is particularly interested in advanced pain management techniques that, combined with 
minimally invasive surgery, can lead to less discomfort and a more rapid return to work and leisure 
activities. Dr. Nasar's experience as a mechanical engineer gives him an intimate knowledge of the 
design and function of artificial joint prostheses allowing him to select the most appropriate device 
for each patient.  
 
Today, the surgeons at Advanced Orthopedics and Sports Medicine Institute (AOSMI) provide the 
Monmouth and Middlesex County communities with specialists for every orthopedic need. Located 
in the Pond View Professional Park at 301 Professional View Drive in Freehold, New Jersey, 
Advanced Orthopedics and Sports Medicine Institute provides advanced medical care with leading 
doctors and surgeons, with state-of-the-art technology, and exceptional Patient-Centered, Patient-
Focused Care™. The practicing physicians at AOSMI have a combined 100 plus years of experience 
providing exceptional orthopedic care to the New Jersey communities of Monmouth and Middlesex 
Counties. They have offices located in Freehold, Monroe, Lake Como and Old Bridge, New Jersey. 
For more information, call 732-720-2555 or visit http://www.AdvancedOrthoSports.com.  

 
 

5. Location of Press Release  

Country   USA 

State       NJ    

City   Freehold 

 

6. Contact Information  

Company Name            Advanced Orthopedics and Sports Medicine Institute, PC 

Your Name                    Dr. Alan Nasar 

Phone Number              732-720-2555 

Email Address              info@AdvancedOrthoSports.com 

Website Address           www.AdvancedOrthoSports.com   
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